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Editorial Review

From Publishers Weekly
Starred Review. Mystery maven Penzler has gathered 17 stories from top writers for an all-original suspense
anthology with results that are about the same as if a master chocolatier had assembled a new sampler box:
everything of high quality but with enough variety to appeal to all tastes. All the contributors are true to their
own very familiar voices. Ed McBain's "Improvisation," a chilling story of two young actresses who commit
murder to learn what it feels like, is cut-to-the-bone sharp. In the haunting "Cielo Azul," Michael Connelly
allows both detective Harry Bosch and profiler Terry McCaleb to brood, as only they can, about a murder
victim never identified. In "Dear Penthouse Forum (A First Draft)," Laura Lippman uses an original format
to showcase a truly frightening woman with a most unusual collecting mania who preys on men in airports.
S.J. Rozan's "The Last Kiss" features a dangerous woman who's all the more dangerous because at first she
seems so sympathetic. Jeffrey Deaver's "Born Bad" is a brilliant double play, with tight characterizations and
an unforgettable plot twist. It's a joy to watch these talented authors, who also include J.A. Jance, Elmore
Leonard, Walter Mosley and Joyce Carol Oates, embrace the short story form and produce magic.
Copyright © Reed Business Information, a division of Reed Elsevier Inc. All rights reserved.

From Booklist
Mystery guru Penzler (prolific editor, bookseller, and founder of Mysterious Press) has convinced 17
contemporary mystery writers to submit never-before-published short stories for this anthology. The lineup
includes plenty of heavyweights: Ed McBain, Anne Perry, Elmore Leonard, Joyce Carol Oates, and Ian
Rankin. Penzler's introduction showcases the entire squad and provides a witty look at dangerous women in
mysteries past, such as Philip Marlowe's Brigid O'Shaughnessy and Conan Doyle's Irene Adler. The stories,
just about all of which feature a woman gleefully luring a hapless male to destruction, often rely on abrupt
power shifts, as in McBain's "Improvisation," which begins with a seductress in a bar saying, "Why don't we
kill somebody?" Oates sustains suspense through a pathological love letter in "Give Me Your Heart," and
Laura Lippman's "Dear Penthouse Forum (A First Draft)" delivers a twisted O'Henry ending. The cumulative
effect is more than a little poisonous--best to take these small ampoules of crime one at a time. Connie
Fletcher
Copyright © American Library Association. All rights reserved

Review
"This is a sterling collection that should both entertain and serve as an introduction to some formidable
talents."

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Nancy Farley:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As
you may know that book is very important for all of us. The book Dangerous Women seemed to be making
you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It is extremely
advantages for you. The e-book Dangerous Women is not only giving you more new information but also to
become your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your spend time to read your publication.
Try to make relationship using the book Dangerous Women. You never really feel lose out for everything
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should you read some books.

Maria Green:

Here thing why this Dangerous Women are different and reliable to be yours. First of all reading through a
book is good nonetheless it depends in the content of the usb ports which is the content is as delicious as
food or not. Dangerous Women giving you information deeper and in different ways, you can find any guide
out there but there is no publication that similar with Dangerous Women. It gives you thrill studying journey,
its open up your personal eyes about the thing that will happened in the world which is probably can be
happened around you. You can bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your approach home by train.
Should you be having difficulties in bringing the published book maybe the form of Dangerous Women in e-
book can be your substitute.

Charlotte Cooper:

This book untitled Dangerous Women to be one of several books that best seller in this year, that is because
when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy that book in the book
store or you can order it through online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you
quickly to read this book, because you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason to you
personally to past this reserve from your list.

Kathleen Hernandez:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their leisure time with
their family, or their very own friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, likely to
beach, or picnic inside the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to
something different to fill your own free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book may be option to fill your
free time/ holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you
want to try look for book, may be the guide untitled Dangerous Women can be fine book to read. May be it
could be best activity to you.
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